
$935,000 - 7 Flower Garland Road, Santa Fe
MLS® #202403180 

$935,000
3 Bedroom, 4.00 Bathroom, 2,365 sqft
Residential on 0.19 Acres

Oshara Village, Santa Fe, NM

New construction scheduled to break ground
late summer by award-winning, BOSS
Builders. Known for their innovative designs
and high quality construction, this to be built
custom home will be sure to impress. With 3
bedrooms, 3 bathrooms, 2-car garage with an
exceptional floor plan suited for modern living.
A total of 2,365 heated sq.ft., 550 sq.ft.
garage, and 300 sq.ft. of covered portals.
Large primary bedroom / bathroom suite,
thoughtfully placed on one side of the home
for privacy. Elegant primary bath with a large
walk in closet. Open concept kitchen, dining
and living room. Guest wing with two
bedrooms and en suite bathrooms and a
dedicated office space to top it off.
Construction to begin soon. Renderings and/or
floor plans may not be an exact representation
of the final product. All details and finishes are
subject to change in the field at the discretion
of the builder.  Reach out as soon as possible
to be able to have the option to help choose
finishes. Estimated time to completion, 6
months.

Built in 2024

Listing Details

Listing Agent Benjamin Tercero

Listing Office Keller Williams Realty

Essential Information



MLS® # 202403180

Price $935,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 4.00

Full Baths 3

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 2,365

Square Footage 2365 SquareFeet

Acres 0.19

Year Built 2024

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Contemporary, One Story, Spanish

Status Active

Community Information

Address 7 Flower Garland Road

Area 27-South of I-25

Subdivision Oshara Village

City Santa Fe

County Santa Fe

State NM

Zip Code 87508

Amenities

Amenities Playground

Utilities Electricity Available

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Attached, Garage

# of Garages 2

Interior

Interior Features No Interior Steps

Heating Forced Air

Cooling Central Air, Refrigerated

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Gas

Stories One



Exterior

Exterior Frame, Stucco

Roof Flat

Construction Frame, Stucco

Foundation Slab

School Information

Elementary Amy Biehl Community

Middle Milagro

High Santa Fe

Additional Information

Date Listed August 8th, 2024

Days on Market 429

HOA Fees 72

HOA Fees Freq. Monthly
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