
$3,950,000 - 7 Camino Don Patron, Santa Fe
MLS® #202501330 

$3,950,000
6 Bedroom, 7.00 Bathroom, 4,492 sqft
Residential on 2.50 Acres

N/A, Santa Fe, NM

Wind your way along lovely Tano Rd. to this
fabulous creatively contemporary estate. The
original part of the home was designed by
award winning architect, Jeff Harner and built
in 2000. In 2018, an addition paid homage to
his design, more than doubling the size of the
home, but keeping a continuity to the
conceptual contemporary creation. Natural
light from windows integrate into every part of
the home melding its beautifully composed
and landscaped exteriors with its exceptional
interior spaces. In addition to its pure design
aesthetic of sleek and sophisticated living,
great attention went into making the home an
organizational dream, with ability to store and
organize within drawers, cabinetry and closets.
This unparalleled home provides an exquisite
place to entertain and enjoy life. Quality
materials, cabinetry, appliances, fixtures and
finishes create one of the most strikingly
designed homes in all of Santa Fe.The home
has a crisp, light and enchanting feel, with
detailed perfection in both design and
execution. The rooms are Spacious and
versatile. Elegant landscaping and a private
gated setting assure views and tranquility. A 2
bedroom guest house was added in 2023 and
the adjacent 2.5 acre lot was purchased for
added privacy.  The lot is offered separately.

Built in 2018

Listing Details



Listing Agent Danna Cooper

Listing Office Sotheby's Int. RE/Washington

Essential Information

MLS® # 202501330

Price $3,950,000

Bedrooms 6

Bathrooms 7.00

Full Baths 2

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 4,492

Square Footage 4492 SquareFeet

Acres 2.50

Year Built 2018

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Contemporary

Status Active

Community Information

Address 7 Camino Don Patron

Area 25N- NW Quadrant-N

Subdivision N/A

City Santa Fe

County Santa Fe

State NM

Zip Code 87506

Amenities

Utilities High Speed Internet Available

Features Drip Irrigation/Bubblers

Parking Spaces 10

Parking Attached, Garage

# of Garages 2

Pool None

Interior

Interior Carpet, Concrete

Interior Features No Interior Steps



Appliances Dryer, Dishwasher, Gas Cooktop, Disposal, Gas Water Heater,
Microwave, Oven, Range, Refrigerator, Washer, Water Heater

Heating Forced Air, Radiant

Cooling Ductless, Refrigerated, Central Air

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

Fireplaces Wood Burning

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Frame, Stucco

Lot Description Drip Irrigation/Bubblers

Roof Composition, Metal, Pitched

Construction Frame, Stucco

School Information

Elementary Carlos Gilbert

Middle Milagro

High Santa Fe

Additional Information

Date Listed April 17th, 2025

Days on Market 177

HOA Fees 500

HOA Fees Freq. Annually
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