
$925,000 - 218 De Fouri Street, Santa Fe
MLS® #202503069 

$925,000
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 1,305 sqft
Residential on 0.13 Acres

N/A, Santa Fe, NM

Be in the middle of it all! Â Iconic Santa Fe
home in the Guadalupe District. Â A few easy
blocks from the Historic Santa Fe Plaza and
even closer to the Santa Fe Railyard Arts
District and Farmerâ€™s Market.
Â Seventy-five steps to the nearest coffee
shop, 50 steps to the nearest restaurant. The
house is light and airy with beautiful windows
in every room still sporting their original
1930â€™s brass hardware. Â The home has
an open living and dining area with pocket
doors, and a fireplace with Vermont Castings
wood stove insert. The spacious kitchen looks
out on the peaceful back yard and large,
partially shaded redwood deck. There are two
bedrooms and a large bathroom with both a
shower and an elegant claw footed tub.Â 
Throughout the house there are wood floors
including the kitchen and bathroom. The
property is private, surrounded by a gated
partial adobe wall and coyote fences with two
covered off street parking spaces within the
walled area. Â This super location is verry
walkable, close to art galleries, shopping
grocery stores museums, parks and access to
Santa Feâ€™s trail systemâ€”the best of
Santa Fe is right out your front door from this
lovely home, such a rare opportunity.

Listing Details

Listing Agent Deborah Day

Listing Office Sotheby's Int. RE/Grant



Essential Information

MLS® # 202503069

Price $925,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 1,305

Square Footage 1305 SquareFeet

Acres 0.13

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Pueblo

Status Active

Community Information

Address 218 De Fouri Street

Area 3N-SF City SE North

Subdivision N/A

City Santa Fe

County Santa Fe

State NM

Zip Code 87501

Amenities

Utilities High Speed Internet Available, Electricity Available

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Carport

Interior

Interior Wood

Interior Features No Interior Steps

Appliances Dryer, Dishwasher, Electric Cooktop, Disposal, Gas Water Heater,
Refrigerator, Washer, Oven, Range

Heating Forced Air

Cooling None

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Wood Burning Stove

Stories One



Has Basement Yes

Basement Crawl Space

Exterior

Exterior Frame

Roof Flat

Construction Frame

Foundation Basement

School Information

Elementary Unknown

Middle Unknown

High Unknown

Additional Information

Date Listed July 14th, 2025

Days on Market 92
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