
$349,000 - 17 Aquaje, Tres Piedras
MLS® #202503323 

$349,000
1 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,082 sqft
Residential on 38.90 Acres

N/A, Tres Piedras, NM

This efficient custom designed solar home will
offer room to roam along with inspiring
sunrises, sunsets and starry night skies. Enjoy
spacious, secluded, off-grid living near Taos,
NM.  Straw bale/frame/stucco constructed
home is on 38.9 acres that borders Carson
National Forest in a private gated community. 
Stunning pinon framed views of the Sangre de
Cristo Range extend from Santa Fe to
Colorado. The home is cozy and inviting,
featuring an open floor plan for ease of
movement and views.   Stylish earth and
artisanal natural plaster walls along with
attention to wooden design create an earthy
and grounded environment in this passive and
active solar-powered home.   Green utilities
include a self-supplied water catchment/cistern
system and an efficient solar energy system. 
Make this a permanent home, artistâ€™s or
writerâ€™s retreat just enough off the beaten
path, yet an easy scenic ride will take you to
colorful Taos for entertainment, skiing and
great food.  Abundant hiking, biking, scenery
and wildlife are at your front door awaiting your
adventures. Rio Grande del Norte National
Monument, Wheeler Peak Wilderness and
Carson Nation Forest are only a partial list of
nearby public lands to enjoy.

Built in 1998

Listing Details

Listing Agent Lizabeth Jamison



Listing Office EXIT Realty Home & Ranch

Essential Information

MLS® # 202503323

Price $349,000

Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 1

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,082

Square Footage 1082 SquareFeet

Acres 38.90

Year Built 1998

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Northern New Mexico

Status Active

Community Information

Address 17 Aquaje

Area 70-Taos and Environ

Subdivision N/A

City Tres Piedras

County Taos

State NM

Zip Code 87557

Amenities

Parking Spaces 6

Parking Detached, Garage

# of Garages 2

Interior

Interior Features No Interior Steps

Heating Passive Solar, Wood Stove

Cooling None

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Wood Burning Stove



Stories Two

Exterior

Exterior Frame, Straw

Roof Metal

Construction Frame, Straw

School Information

Elementary Taos

Middle Taos Jr High

High Taos High School

Additional Information

Date Listed July 22nd, 2025

Days on Market 81
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