
$295,000 - 1276 Cheyenne Street, Los Alamos
MLS® #202503343 

$295,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,596 sqft
Residential on 0.16 Acres

N/A, Los Alamos, NM

Donâ€™t miss this incredible opportunity to
own a 3-bedroom, 2-bath home situated on a
spacious corner lot in the Tsikumu Village
neighborhood of Los Alamos. The home
underwent an interior renovation in 2021,
which included a modern kitchen with ample
countertops, many cabinets, recessed lighting,
and stainless steel appliances. Durable
wood-vinyl flooring runs through the living
area, while vinyl tile is in the dining room, and
updated laminate flooring is in the primary
bedroom. The open-concept layout offers a
bright and welcoming space thatâ€™s
completely move-in ready. Step outside to a
private, fully fenced backyard perfect for
relaxing or entertaining. Enjoy the
low-maintenance Trex deck, mature trees, and
a shed with electricity, perfect for a workshop,
studio, or additional storage. The property also
includes a gated carport and ample off-street
parking. This large corner lot offers extra
space and plenty of curb appeal. Come see all
that this well-located home has to offer.
Schedule a private showing today.

Built in 1975

Listing Details

Listing Agent Heather Jelinek

Listing Office New Mexico Real Estate Group L

Essential Information



MLS® # 202503343

Price $295,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 1,596

Square Footage 1596 SquareFeet

Acres 0.16

Year Built 1975

Type Residential

Sub-Type Manufactured Home

Style Manufactured Home, Mobile Home

Status Active

Community Information

Address 1276 Cheyenne Street

Area 55-Tsikumu Village

Subdivision N/A

City Los Alamos

County Los Alamos

State NM

Zip Code 87544

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Carport

Interior

Interior Features No Interior Steps

Appliances Dryer, Dishwasher, Oven, Range, Refrigerator, Washer

Heating Forced Air

Cooling Evaporative Cooling

Stories One

Has Basement Yes

Basement Crawl Space

Exterior

Roof Metal, Other, See Remarks



School Information

Elementary Barranca

Middle Los Alamos Middle School

High Los Alamos High

Additional Information

Date Listed July 24th, 2025

Days on Market 78

HOA Fees 70

HOA Fees Freq. Annually
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