
$695,000 - 208 Sunrise Road, Santa Fe
MLS® #202503733 

$695,000
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,176 sqft
Residential on 2.00 Acres

N/A, Santa Fe, NM

Modern southwest oasis with panoramic views
from the Sangre De Christos clear down to the
Sandias! Situated on a beautiful hillside with
mature vegetation, this home has been
extensively remodeled and completely
transformed. The property consists of 3
bedrooms, 2 and a half bathrooms, detached
art studio, 2 acres, 2 car garage, private well
and just down the road from the hot springs of
Ojo Santa Fe. Enjoy the peace and tranquility
La Cienega has to offer while being a quick
ride from all the amenities of Santa Fe. With
an easy hop on i-25 to Albuquerque, the
versatility of the location can't be beat. This
spacious sanctuary has been lovingly restored
by a crew of artisans and builders with custom
details throughout. Brand new kitchen and
bathrooms, luxury vinyl plank, on demand hot
water, and a completely redone driveway loop
just to name a few of the many upgrades.
Additionally a new 1500 gallon septic system
allows for you to continue expanding the
residence if you so choose. The detached
studio with a newly installed mini-split, its own
parking, and wrap around deck provides the
perfect space to retreat for artists, creatives or
those who work from home. Cozy up in the
winter next to the huge stone fireplace or the
vintage Malm wood burning stove. Spend a
lazy morning in the comfort of your 420 sq/ft
primary suite. A gardeners paradise, this
beautifully landscaped property provides
plenty of outdoor space for entertaining and
relaxation, just a short walk from the Ojo Santa



Fe spa and a mile down the road from the
historic Los Golondrinas ranch and event
space, a true Santa Fe gem. Hike the
petroglyphs trail right around the corner and
experience all the centuries old history and
natural beauty that La Cienega has to offer.
Owner is licensed New Mexico real estate
agent.

Built in 1975

Listing Details

Listing Agent Emilie Adamovic

Listing Office Coldwell Banker Mountain Prop

Essential Information

MLS® # 202503733

Price $695,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 2

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 2,176

Square Footage 2176 SquareFeet

Acres 2.00

Year Built 1975

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style One Story, Ranch

Status Active

Community Information

Address 208 Sunrise Road

Area 6-La Cienega Area

Subdivision N/A

City Santa Fe

County Santa Fe

State NM

Zip Code 87507



Amenities

Utilities High Speed Internet Available, Electricity Available

Parking Spaces 10

Parking Attached, Garage, RV Access/Parking

# of Garages 2

Pool None

Interior

Interior Tile, Vinyl

Interior Features No Interior Steps

Appliances Dishwasher, Oven, Range, Refrigerator

Heating Forced Air, Fireplace(s), Natural Gas, Wood Stove

Cooling None

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Insert, Wood Burning, Wood Burning Stove

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Frame, Stucco

Roof Pitched, Metal

Construction Frame, Stucco

Foundation Slab

School Information

Elementary Nina Otero Community School

Middle Nina Otero Community School

High Capital

Additional Information

Date Listed August 14th, 2025

Days on Market 61

Zoning Rural Residential
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